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Agency Tracking ID:PGA3149560 Authorization
Number:ACH

Successful Authorization -- Date Paid: 9/19/18
FILE COPY ONLY!!

EAD INSTRUCTIONS FEDERAL COMMUNICATIONS COMMISSION APPROVED BY OM

REMITTANCE ADVICE 306005
ROCEEDING SPECIAL USE

FORM 159
I) LOCKBOX #979089 PAGE NO I OF I FCC USE ONLY

SECTION A - Payer Information
2) PAYER NAME (if paying by credit card, enter name exactly as it appears on your card) 3) TOTAL AMOUNT PAID (dollars and cents)
ummit Public Radio and TV, Inc. $400.00

4) STREET ADDRESS LINE NO. 1

.O. Box 6392
5) STREET ADDRESS LINE NO. 2

25 SCR 528
6) CITY

	

7) STATE

	

8) ZIP CODE
Breckenridge

	

0

	

0424-6392
9) DAYTIME TELEPHONE NUMBER (INCLUDING AREA CODE) 10) COUNTRY CODE (IF NOT IN U.S.A.)
70-4539293 S

FCC REGISTRATION NUMBER (FRN) AND TAX IDENTIFICATION NUMBER (TIN) REQUIRED
I) PAYER (FRN) 12) FCC USE ONLY
006985204

IF PAYER NAME AND THE APPLICANT NAME ARE DIFFERENT, COMPLETE SECTION B
IF MORE THAN ONE APPLICANT, USE CONTINUATION SHEETS (FORM 159-C)

13) APPLICANT NAME

ummit Public Radio and TV, Inc.
14) STREET ADDRESS LINE NO. I

P.O. Box 6392
IS) STREET ADDRESS LINE NO. 2
25 SCR 528
16) CITY

	

17) STATE

	

18) ZIP CODE
Breckenridge

	

0

	

0424-6392
19) DAYTIME TELEPHONE NUMBER (INCLUDING AREA CODE) (20) COUNTRY CODE (IF NOT IN U.S.A.)
704539293 US

FCC REGISTRATION NUMBER (FRN) AND TAX IDENTIFICATION NUMBER (TIN) REQUIRED
21) APPLICANT (FRN) 22) FCC USE ONLY
006985204

COMPLETE SECTION C FOR EACH SERVICE, IF MORE BOXES ARE NEEDED, USE CONTINUATION SHEET

23A) FCC Call Sign/Oilier ID 24A) Payment Type Codc(PTC) 25A) Quantity

DKO8EM MGL
26A) Fee Due for (PTC) 27A) Total Fee FCC Use Only

$200.00 $200.00
2%A) FCC CODE I 25.tA) FCC CODE 2

N/A N/A

	

____________
23B) FCC Call Sign/Other ID 24B) Payment Type Code(PTC) 25B) Quantity

DKI2EK MGL I
26B) Fee Due for (PTC) 27B) Total Fee FCC Usc Only

$200.00 $200.00
2813) FCC CODE 1

_________________

2913) FCC CODE 2

N/A N/A
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Mohammad Habib

From:

	

Lawrence M. Miller <LMlLLER@gsblaw.com >
Sent:

	

Monday, October 29, 2018 11:47 AM
To:

	

Mohammad Habib
Cc:

	

Hossein Hashemzadeh; Gary Peterson
Subject:

	

FW: Summit Public Radio and TV, Inc. STA extension requests
Attachments:

	

K1 2EK-D BESTA-201 8031 5ABF.pdf; KO8EM-D BESTA-201 8031 SABE.pdf

Mohammed -

Thanks for your call. Here is a copy of the email that I sent to you on August 30, 2018 asking for further extension of the

STAs to operate K12EDD and KO8EM-D. just sent you a few minutes ago the proof of payment of the filing fees.

Please let me know if anything else is needed.

Best,

Larry

From: Lawrence M. Miller

Sent: Tuesday, September 4, 2018 10:43 AM

To: 'mohammad.habib@fcc.gov ' <mohammad.habib@fcc.gov>; 'hossein.hashemzadeh@fcc.gov '
<hossein.hashemzadeh@fcc.gov >
Cc: 'gpeterson@ieee.org ' <gpeterson@ieee.org >
Subject: FW: Summit Public Radio and TV, Inc. STA extension requests

Hossein and Mohamrnad -

Thank you for Mohammed's call this morning. I think we have provided the same information as we did for the most

recent granted request for STA. However we need file numbers for the new STA requests so that Summit can pay the
filing fees.

Best,

Larry

From: Lawrence M. Miller

Sent: Thursday, August 30, 2018 2:20 PM

To: 'hossein.hashemzadeh@fcc.gov ' <hoseiri.hashemçfccgov>

Cc: 'mohammad.habib@fcc.gov ' <moharnm .adhabibfççgpv>; 'Gary Peterson' <g.petersçp)tfcbooks.com >; Yvette
Graves

Subject: Summit Public Radio and TV, Inc. STA extension requests

Hossein -

On behalf of Summit Public Radio & TV, Inc., we hereby request extension of the STAs to operate the
television translators with temporary call signs of K12EK and KO8EM for an additional six months beyond the
current STA expiration date of September 21, 2018. The reason is the same as in previous filings. Summit
awaits an opportunity to file for new CPs for these facilities that provide television service to a population that
otherwise would not receive the signals of the stations carried because of mountainous terrain. I am
forwarding copies of the most recent extension grants. Those grants were processed in CDBS and you
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advised us when you moved the facilities back into CDBS that we could file email requests for additional STA
extensions. Summit will pay the fees online with Form 159 when you tell us that the system is ready to accept
the payments.

Please let me know if there is anything else we need to do to get the requested extensions.

Best,
Larry

LAWRENCE M. MILLER

Attorney 202.2982534 Tel 202.965.1729 Fax lmillerqsblaw.corn

U 000'

	

U 00

	

2nd Floor

	

1000 Potomac Street NW Washirgton, DC 20007 I

	

GO BLow.com
This e-mail is for the sole use of the intended recipient(s). It contains information that is confidential and/or legally privileged. If you
believe that it has been sent to you in error, please notify the sender by reply e-mail and delete the message. Any disclosure, copying,
distribution or use of this information by someone other than the intended recipient is prohibited.

2



Mohammad Habib

From:

	

Lawrence M. Miller <LMlLLER@gsblaw.com >
Sent:

	

Monday, October29, 2018 11:43 AM
To:

	

Mohammad Habib
Subject:

	

FW: Summit Public Radio and TV, Inc. STA extension requests
Attachments:

	

Form 159 for 9-2018 STA Renewals.pdf

From: Gary Peterson [mailto:g.peterson@tfcbooks.com ]
Sent: Wednesday, September 19, 2018 10:14 AM
To: Lawrence M. Miller <LMlLLER@gsblaw.com >

Cc: Jane Hankison (treasurer@sprtv.org ) <treasurer@sprtv.org>; John Mirro (john@creativepeaks.com )
<john@creativepeaks.com >; gpeterson@ieee.org
Subject: RE: Summit Public Radio and TV, Inc. STA extension requests

Success!

From: Gary Peterson

Sent: Wednesday, September 19, 2018 7:39 AM

To: Lawrence M.

Cc: Jane Hankison (su

	

rtv.ofg) <

	

surer sprtv.or>; John Mirro (john@creativepeaks.com )
<rveealts.com>; gponieee.or
Subject: RE: Summit Public Radio and TV, Inc. STA extension requests

Got it. Thanks!

From: Lawrence M. Miller <LMlLLER@gsblaw.com >

Sent: Wednesday, September 19, 2018 7:38 AM

To: Gary Peterson

Cc: Jane Hankison (treasurer

	

tv.or) <treasurer@sprtv.org>; John Mirro (john@creativepeaks.com )
<jçrtiçom>; gpeterson@ieee.org

Subject: Re: Summit Public Radio and TV, Inc. STA extension requests

MGL. The fee is up to $200.

Sent from roy 1-MobUe 4G LTE Device

Original message --------

From: Gary Peterson <gsontfcpoj.com >

Date: 9/19/18 9:15 AM (GMT-05:00)

To: "Lawrence M. Miller"

Cc: "Jane Hankison (

	

surer sprtyor)" <treasurerpjyofg>, "John Mirro (jpflt@creativepeaks.com )"

<iohn@.eative

	

ks. co m>,

Subject: RE: Summit Public Radio and TV, Inc. STA extension requests

Larry, Jane,
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I was unable to submit the filing fees before midnight ET yesterday due to a possible issue with the online Fee

Filer System. Searching through the available options I found no PlC amount matching an Extension of STA
Request filing fee of $190 each.

A request for assistance from the Financial Operations Help Desk has been recorded on their voice mail but a
reply is yet to be received.

Can you provide me with an appropriate PTC?

Shtt pps:/f a pcc. gov FeeFiler/lo n,cfm
FRN 0006985204

979089 - Media

KO8EM-D DKO8EM File 4*: BESTA-20180904AAV
K12EK-D DK12EK File 4*: BESTA-20180904AAW

Financial Operations Help Desk: (877) 480-3201, option 6; (Mon-Fri. 8 a.m.-6:00 p.m. El)
Have no PTC for Extension of STA Request.

Regards,

Gary

Gary Peterson

SPRTV Vice President & Chief Engineer
(970) 453-6692 (Phone/Fax)

(970) 485-2188 (C)

"Committed to best practices and dedicated to serving the Blue River Valley Community."

EK-D BESTA-201 8031 5ABF.pdf
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FEDERAL COUNICATIQNS CONMISSION
445 12 Street, S.W.
Washington DC 20554

March 22, 2018

Summit Public Radio and TV, mc.
Gary Peterson
P. 0. Pox 6392
Breckenridge, CO 80424-6392

In ye: Special Temporary Authority Request of:
Summit Public Radio and TV, Inc.
Channel E, Ereckenricige, CO
Temporary Call Sign, KO8EM-D
EESTA-20180315ABE
Sac. ID: 5t407

5t1Cfl

This refers to your request for extension of Special Temporary
Authorization in connection with the above-captioned low power teJcvision
or television translator station,

Your request IS HEREBY GRANTED and the Special Temporary authority and
terms of FCC notification of September 21, 2011 are extended to expIre
Ocoteubur 21, 2018 . This authority is conditioned upon the avoidance
nterterence to any existing facilities.

'3 hem z a de h
De5

	

'ief
Video Division
Media Bureau

Cc: Lawrence N Miller,


