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Agency Tracking ID:PGA3071701
Authorization Number:ACH
Successful Authorization -- Date Paid: 3/20/18
FILE COPY ONLY!!

READ INSTRUCTIONS FEDERAL COMMUNICATIONS COMMISSION APPROVED BY OMB
ICAREFULLY BEFORE 3060-05%
PROCEEDING REMITTANCE ADVICE ISPECIAL USE

FORM 159

1) LOCKBOX #979089 PAGENO 1 0F I Ecc USE ONLY

SECTION A - Payer Information

2) PAYER NAME (if paying by credit card, enter name exactly as it appears on your card) 3) TOTAL AMOUNT PAID (dollars and cents)
Summit Public Radio and TV, Inc. $380.00
4) STREET ADDRESS LINE NO. |
P.O. Box 6392
5) STREET ADDRESS LINE NO. 2
525 SCR 528 :
6)CITY 7) STATE 8) ZIP CODL
Breckenridge CO 80424-6392
9) DAYTIME TELEPHONE NUMBER (INCLUDING AREA CODE) 10) COUNTRY CODE (IF NOTINU.S.A))
970-4539293 US
FCC REGISTRATION NUMBER (FRN) AND TAX IDENTIFICATION NUMBER (TIN) REQUIRED

11) PAYER (FRN) 12) FCC USE ONLY
0006985204

IF PAYER NAME AND THE APPLICANT NAME ARE DIFFERENT, COMPLETE SECTION B
IF MORE THAN ONE APPLICANT, USE CONTINUATION SHEETS (FORM 159-C)

13) APPLICANT NAME
iSummit Public Radio and TV, Inc.
14) STREET ADDRESS LINE NO. 1

P.O. Box 6392
15) STREET ADDRESS LINE NO. 2
525 SCR 528
s LS S T s S v X
16) CITY 17) STATE 18) ZIP CODE
Breckenridge ' icCO 80424-6392
T hcay Vet e reee
19) DAYTIME TELEPHONE NUMBER (INCLUDING AREA CODE) 20) COUNTRY CODE (IF NOTINU.S.A.)
970-4539293 US
FCC REGISTRATION NUMBER (FRN) AND TAX IDENTIFICATION NUMBER (TIN) REQUIRED
21) APPLICANT (FRN) 22) FCC USE ONLY
0006985204
COMPLETE SECTION C FOR EACH SERVICE, IF MORE BOXES ARE NEEDED, USE CONTINUATION SHEET
23A) FCC Call Sign/Other ID 24A) Payment Type Code(PTC) 25A) Quantity
KO0S8EM-D MGF 1
26A) Fee Due for (PTC) 27A) Total Fee FCC Use Only
$190.00 $190.00
28A) FCC CODE | 29A) FCC CODE 2
55407 BESTA-20180315ABE
23B) FCC Call Sign/Other ID 24B) Payment Type Code(PTC) 25B) Quantity
K12EK-D MGF 1
26B) Fee Due for (PTC) 27B) Total Fee FCC Use Only

https://pay.fcc.gov/ElectronicForm159/success 159 html/printed159 success.cfm 3/20/2018



FCC:Success:Form 159 - PRINTABLE VERSION Page 2 of 2
$190.00 | $190.00 |
28B) FCC CODE I 29B) FCC CODE 2
55409 BESTA-20180315ABF
https://pay.fcc.gov/ElectronicForm159/success_159_html/printed159_success.cfm 3/20/2018



Online Payment Page 1 of 1

FCC Federal

C o) Gommunications
3 <= Commisstor

Online Payment ) - o
Step 3: Confirm Payment 11213

Thank you.
Your transaction has been successfully completed.

Pay.gov Tracking Information
Application Name: Remittance Advice
Pay.gov Tracking ID: 268G5RVJ
Agency Tracking ID: PGA3071701
Transaction Date and Time: 03/20/2018 15:02 EDT
Payment Summary

Account Holder Name: Summit Public Radio and TV, Inc.
Payment Amount: $380.00

Account Type: Business Checking - Payment Date: 03/21/2018
Routing Number: 107005047

Account Number: ******5777

https://www.pay.gov/agency/oci/v2/payments/authorizePayment 3/20/2018
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FC 445 12™ gtreet, S.W.

Washington DC 20554
&

T USA

L
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September 18, 2017

Summit Public Radio and TV, Inc.
Gary Peterson

P. O. Box 6392

Breckenridge, CO 80424-6392

In re: Special Temporary Authority Request of:
Summit Public Radio and TV, Inc.
Channel 8, Breckenridge, CO
Temporary Call Sign, KO08EM-D
BSTA-20170908AAP
Fac. ID: 55407

Gentlemen:

This refers to your request for extension of Special Temporary
Authorization in connection with the above- captloned low power television
or television translator station.

Your request IS HEREBY GRANTED and the Special Temporary authority and
terms of FCC notification of September 21, 2011 are extended to expire
March 21, 2018. This authority is conditioned upon the avoidance of
interference to any existing facilities.

Sincerely,

vVidéo Division
Media Bureau

cc: Lawrence M Miller, Esquire



Mohammad Habib

From: Lawrence M. Miller <LMILLER@gsblaw.com>

Sent: Thursday, March 15, 2018 3:59 PM

To: Mohammad Habib

Cc: gpeterson@ieee.org; Yvette Graves

Subject: FW: Request for STA extensions for DK12EK and DKOSEM
Attachments: STA grant for KOBEM-D 091817.pdf; STA grant for K12EK-D 091817.pdf
Mohammad -

Please let us know when file numbers are assigned to these STA requests and we will pay the filing fees.

Best,
Larry

From: Lawrence M. Miller

Sent: Thursday, March 15, 2018 1:15 PM

To: 'hossein.hashemzadeh@fcc.gov' <hossein.hashemzadeh@fcc.gov>

Cc: 'mohammad.habib@fcc.gov' <mohammad. hablb@fcc gov>; 'Gary Peterson' <g.peterson@tfcbooks.com>; Yvette
Graves <ygraves@gsblaw.com>

Subject: Request for STA extensions for DK12EK and DKOSEM

Hossein —

On behalf of Summit Public Radio and TV, Inc., we hereby request extension of the STAs to operate DK12EK
and DKOBEM for an additional six months beyond the current STA expiration date of March 21, 2018. The
reason is the same as in previous filings. Summit awaits an opportunity to file for new CPs for these facilities
that provide television service to a population that otherwise would not receive the signals of the stations
carried because of mountainous terrain. | am forwarding copies of the most recent extension grants. Those
were requested by email and handled in CDBS. Summit will pay the fees online with Form 159.

Please let me know if there is anything else we need to do to get the requested extensions.

Best,
Larry

LAWRENCE M. MILLER
Attorney | 202.208.2534 Tel | 202.965.1729 Fax | Imiller@gsblaw.com
GARVEY SCHUBERT BARER | 2nd Floor | 1000 Potomac Street NW | Washington, DC 20007 | » GSBLaw.com

This e-mail is for the sole use of the intended recipient(s). It contains information that is confidential and/or legally privileged. If you
believe that it has been sent to you in error, please notify the sender by reply e-mail and delete the message. Any disclosure, copying,
distribution or use of this information by someone other than the intended recipient is prohibited.




Mohammad Habib

From: Lawrence M. Miller <LMILLER@gsblaw.com>

Sent: Tuesday, March 20, 2018 3:07 PM

To: Mohammad Habib

Cc: gpeterson@ieee.org; Yvette Graves

Subject: RE: Request for STA extensions for DK12EK and DKOSEM
Attachments: Summit STA Payment Receipt for KOBEM-D and K12EK-D.pdf
Mohammad -

We have paid the filing fees for the two Summit STA extension requests. A copy of the payment receipt is attached and
here is a copy of the email confirmation:

From: notification@pay.gov [mailto:notification@pay.gov]

Sent: Tuesday, March 20, 2018 3:03 PM :
To: Yvette Graves <ygraves@gsblaw.com>; Lawrence M. Miller <LMILLER@gsblaw.com>
Subject: Pay.gov Payment Confirmation: Remittance Advice

Your payment has been submitted to Pay.gov and the details are below. If you have any questions or wish to cancel this
payment, you will need to contact FCC Financial Operations Group Help Desk at ARINQUIRIES@fcc.gov at 877-480-3201
option 6.

Application Name: Remittance Advice
Pay.gov Tracking ID: 268G5RV
Agency Tracking ID: PGA3071701

Account Holder Name: Summit Public Radio and TV, Inc.
Transaction Type: ACH Debit

Transaction Amount: $380.00

Payment Date: Mar 21, 2018

Account Type: Business Checking

Routing Number: 107005047

Account Number: **¥**x*xxx*xx5777

Transaction Date: Mar 20, 2018 3:02:54 PM Total Payments Scheduled: 1
Frequency: OneTime

THIS IS AN AUTOMATED MESSAGE. PLEASE DO NOT REPLY.

Best,
Larry

From: Mohammad Habib [mailto:Mohammad.Habib@fcc.gov]
Sent: Tuesday, March 20, 2018 2:36 PM

To: Lawrence M. Miller <LMILLER@gsblaw.com>

Cc: gpeterson@ieee.org; Yvette Graves <ygraves@gsblaw.com>
Subject: RE: Request for STA extensions for DK12EK and DKOSEM

BESTA-20180315ABE, KOBEM-D, BRECKENRIDGE, CO



